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Editorial

Once more, welcome to the second online edition of the 
Journal of Clinical Chiropractic Pediatrics.  Our goal is to pro-
vide a forum for clinicians to follow current research and 
learn from shared clinical reports. We also hope this will 
encourage others to design and conduct research,  publish 
their findings and clinical experiences to facilitate recogni-
tion of chiropractic protocols and the chiropractic adjust-
ment as a viable option for both musculoskeletal and non 
musculoskeletal complaints for pregnant women and chil-
dren.

We are grateful to the academic institutions, governmental 
and chiropractic organizations that support our researchers 
allowing them to conduct and publish research that adds to 
the foundation of evidence medicine.  We are proud to be 
the journal of choice for some of those authors who feel that 
their information will reach the desired audience most in-
volved with the care of the pregnant and pediatric patient.  

Although many journals limit the number of case reports 
they publish so as to not reduce the public impact of the jour-
nal (the quality of a journal is often measured by the num-
ber of citations that result from any given publication1), our 
goal is to support our field practitioners with case reports 
and case series as they may provide guidance in different 
aspects of patient care.   This may include the components of 
taking a thorough history, the performance of a physical ex-
amination, description of advanced diagnostics employed, 
review of records, differential diagnosis, epigenetic factors, 
pharmacologic, psychosocial or socioeconomic influences 
on the chief presenting problems as well as chiropractic 
protocols and collaborative treatments, their effectiveness 
and reporting of possible adverse events and hypothesis 
of the mechanisms of the patient’s complaint and their re-
sponse to treatment (be the outcome positive or negative)2. 

The value of case reports

By Sharon A. Vallone, DC, FICCP

Case reports are most easily undertaken by the field clini-
cian who maintains complete and accurate records. Both re-
markable and “unremarkable” cases need to be written and 
published because each can offer an intrinsic value ranging 
from orienting the new practitioner to the “daily traffic” of 
pediatric patients to supporting a practitioner who faces a 
more unusual presentation.  Case reports that contain an 
extensive review of the relevant literature also serves as a 
springboard for the reader to readily access additional in-
formation pertinent to the case.

Case reports and case series have been deemed valuable in 
all of the healthcare professions for not only the purpose of 
educating the field clinician, but also in helping in research 
design and the formulation and ultimately, evaluation, of 
clinical guidelines.  Internationally, there are organizations 
developing reporting guidelines to “facilitate greater trans-
parency and completeness in the provision of the relevant 
information for individual cases.”3

It behooves our profession to stay current with these guide-
lines and to write and publish in support of the chiropractic 
premise providing a firm foundation for generations of chi-
ropractors and chiropractic patients to come. We invite you 
to participate!
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